
The School Board of Broward County, Florida, prohibits any policy or procedure which results in discrimination on the basis of age, color, disability, gender expression, 
national origin, marital status, race, religion, sex or sexual orientation.  Individuals who wish to file a discrimination complaint, may call the Executive Director, Benefits & EEO 

Compliance at 754-321-2150 or Teletype Machine (TTY) at 754-321-2158.

Individuals with disabilities requesting accommodations under the Americans with Disabilities Act (ADA) may call the Equal Educational Opportunities 

(EEO) at 754-321-2150 or Teletype Machine (TTY) at 754-321-2158.

REVISED: 5/19/2017 

RECOMMENDATION TABULATION 

RFP #: 18-214R Tentative Board Meeting Date*: MAY 8, 2018 

ITB Title: REMANUFACTURED ENGINES # Notified: 515 # Downloaded:  12 

# of Responses Rec’d: 5 # of “No Bids”: 0 

For: 

STUDENT TRANSPORTATION AND FLEET 

SERVICES 
RFP Opening Date : 

3/27/2018 

(School/Department)

Fund: DEPARTMENT OPERATING BUDGET Advertised Date: 3/2/2018 

POSTING OF Select One RECOMMENDATION/TABULATION: Select One Recommendations and Tabulations will be posted in the Procurement 

& Warehousing Services and www.Demandstar.com on _APRIL 9, 2018_________________@ 3:00 pm and will remain posted for 72 hours.  Any 

person who is adversely affected by the decision or intended decision shall file a notice of protest, in writing, within 72 hours after the posting of the 

notice of decision or intended decision. The formal written protest shall be filed within ten (10) days after the date the notice of protest is filed. Failure to 

file a notice of protest or failure to file a formal written protest shall constitute a waiver of proceedings under this chapter. Section 120.57(3)(b), Florida 

Statutes, states that “The formal written protest shall state with particularity the facts and law upon which the protest is based.” Saturdays, Sundays, state 

holidays and days during which the District is closed shall be excluded in the computation of the 72-hour time period provided. Filings shall be at the 

office of the Director of Procurement & Warehousing Services, 7720 West Oakland Park Boulevard, Suite 323, Sunrise, Florida 33351. Any person who 

files an action protesting an intended decision shall post with the School Board, at the time of filing the formal written protest, a bond, payable to The 

School Board of Broward County, Florida, (SBBC), in an amount equal to one percent (1%) of the estimated value of the contract. Failure to post the 

bond required by SBBC Policy 3320, Part VIII, Purchasing Policies, Section N, within the time allowed for filing a bond shall constitute a waiver of the 

right to protest. 

(*) The Cone of Silence, as stated in the ITB / RFP / RFQ / HARD BID, is in effect until it is approved by SBBC.  The Board meeting 

date stated above is tentative.  Confirm with the Purchasing Agent of record for the actual date the Cone of Silence has concluded.  

RECOMMENDATION TABULATION 

VENDORS ITEMS 

JASPER ENGINE EXCHANGE ALTERNATE: ITEM 1, 2, 3,4,5,6 

MATTHEWS BUS ALLIANCE, INC PRIMARY: ITEM 1, 2, 7 

ALTERNATE: ITEM 3,5,6 

RECHTIEN INTERNATIONAL TRUCKS PRIMARY: ITEM 3,4,5,6 

ALTERNATE: ITEM 1,2 

CONTRACT PERIOD MAY 9, 2018 THROUGH MAY 31, 2021 

By: Date: April 9, 2018 

(Purchasing Agent) 
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http://www.demandstar.com/


Bid REJECTION SHEET 

18-214R – REMANUFACTURED ENGINES

REJECT ENTIRE BID FROM CREATIVE BUS SALES.  

IN ACCORDANCE WITH GENERAL CONDITIONS 45.  “A SIGNATURE IS REQUIRED ON 

BOTH THE DEBARMENT FORM AND THE INVITATION TO BID PAGE.  A SIGNATURE 

ON ONE DOCUMENT CANNOT BE SUBSTITUTED FOR THE SIGNATURE REQUIRED 

ON THE OTHER DOCUMENTS.  FAILURE TO COMPLETE AND SIGN BOTH 

DOCUMENTS REQUIRING SIGNATURE SHALL RESULT IN REJECTION OF BID 

SUBMITTED.  CREATIVE BUS SALES FAILED TO SUBMIT A SIGNED DEBARMENT 

FORM.  
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Bid 18-214R - Remanufactured Engines 

Item # Description
Jasper Engine 

Exchange
KVP Enterprise

 Matthews Bus 

Alliance, Inc 

 Rechtien International 

Trucks 

 Florida State 

Preference 

1

SCHOOL BUS ENGINE - LONG BLOCK      

Brand Offered: International Harvest REVIA  - 

Model Offered: DT466E - 1996 to 1999 6,401.00$     No Bid 6,025.00$     6,178.59$     

2

SCHOOL BUS ENGINE - LONG BLOCK      

Brand Offered: International Harvest REVIA  -     

Model Offered: DT466E non EGR- 2000 to 2004 6,401.00$     No Bid 6,148.50$     6,171.72$     

3

SCHOOL BUS ENGINE - LONG BLOCK      

Brand Offered: International Harvest REVIA  -   

Model Offered: DT466E w/EGR - 2005 to 2007 7,418.00$     No Bid 8,295.00$     7,755.66$     7,367.88$    

4

SCHOOL BUS ENGINE - LONG BLOCK      

Brand Offered: International Harvest REVIA  -     

Model Offered: DT466E non EGR- 2000 to 2004 9,062.00$     No Bid No Bid 7,905.60$     

5

SCHOOL BUS ENGINE - LONG BLOCK Brand 

Offered: Caterpillar REVIA  -     

Model Offered: 3126B - 2000 to 2003 8,019.00$     No Bid 7,008.90$     6,665.05$     

6

SCHOOL BUS ENGINE - LONG BLOCK  

Brand Offered: Cummings REVIVA  -     

Model Offered: ISB07/6.7 7,648.00$     8,745.35$     7,761.40$     7,362.65$     

7

SCHOOL BUS ENGINE - LONG BLOCK      

Brand Offered: Mercedes Benz Detroit Diesel 3/4 

Engine  - Model Offered: MBE 926.961 No Bid 16,172.90$     

Awardee - Color Key

Primary Awardee

Alternate Awardee
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